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Court File No. CV-16-11409-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN: 
CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE 

- and -

URBANCORP (LESLIEVILLE) DEVELOPMENTS INC., 
URBANCORP (RIVERDALE) DEVELOPMENTS INC., & 

URBANCORP (THE BEACH) DEVELOPMENTS INC. 

Applicant 

Respondents 

APPLICATION UNDER section 243 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. 
8-3, as amended, section 68 of the Construction Lien Act, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.30, 

and under section 101 of the Courts of Justice Act, R.S.O. 1990, c. C.43 

AFFIDAVIT OF LILLY A. WONG 
(Sworn June 12, 2018) 

I, Lilly A. Wong, Barrister and Solicitor, of the City of Toronto, in the 

Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH AND SAY: 

1. I am a partner in the law firm of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP ("Gowling 

WLG"). I am the billing professional for billings related to Gowling WLG's retainer in 

respect of Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. ("A&M") in relation to its representation of the 

receiver and manager in these proceedings and as such have personal knowledge of the 
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matters that I hereinafter depose, except those matters that are based expressly upon 

information and belief, in which case, I verily believe such information to be true. 

2. Pursuant to an Order of the Honourable Mr. Justice Newbould of the Ontario 

Superior Court of Justice dated May 31, 2016 (the "Appointment Order"), A&M was 

appointed as receiver and manager (in such capacity, the "Receiver''), without security, 

and Construction Lien Trustee (in such capacity, the "Construction Lien Trustee") of all 

of the property, assets, undertakings, and property acquired for, or used in relation to the 

business, including the real property of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. ("UC 

Leslieville"), Urbancorp (Riverdale) Developments Inc. ("UC Riverdale") and Urbancorp 

(The Beach) Developments Inc. ("UC Beach") (together, the "Urbancorp Entities"). 

3. Pursuant to Paragraph 5(f) of the Appointment Order the Receiver and 

Construction Lien Trustee (in such capacities, the "Construction Receiver'') were 

authorized to retain counsel for the Applicant (being Gowling WLG) to advise and 

represent it save and except on matters which the Construction Receiver determines it 

requires independent advice. 

4. Gowling WLG has acted for the Construction Receiver in this matter and 

provided services and incurred disbursements in relation to its representation of the 

Construction Receiver in these proceedings for the period from April 1, 2017 to 

April 30, 2018, as described in the Legal Costs Summary and the detailed invoices for 

Gowling WLG, all of which are attached hereto as Exhibit "A" (the "Gowling WLG 

Dockets"). Paragraph 19 of the Appointment Order provides for the payment of the 
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reasonable fees and disbursements of the Receiver's counsel upon Court approval. The 

Gowling WLG Dockets have been redacted where they reference information subject to 

privilege. The Gowling WLG Dockets are also presented based on fees and expenses 

incurred for each of the relevant Urbancorp Entities and general administration, in 

accordance with paragraph 19 of the Appointment Order. 

5. In connection with this matter, Gowling WLG has taken care to allocate the 

legal services it has provided in connection with the insolvency of the Urbancorp Entities 

between services it has provided to the Applicant and services it has provided to the 

Construction Receiver. 

6. Based on my review of the Gowling WLG Dockets and my personal 

knowledge of this matter, the Gowling WLG Dockets represent a fair and accurate 

description of the services provided and the amounts charged by Gowling WLG. 

7. I swear this affidavit in support of the Construction Receiver's motion for, 

among other things, approval of the Construction Receiver's fees and disbursements and 

those of its counsel and for no other or improper purpose. 

SWORN before me at the City of Toronto, 
in the Province of Ontario, on June 12, 
2018. 

-~---
Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 

~\~ CAA-v 

) 
) 
) 
) 
) 



THIS IS EXHIBIT "A" TO THE 
AFFIDAVIT OF LILLY A. WONG, 

SWORN BEFORE ME ON JUNE 12, 2018 

~---

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits 

~~ Co<A-V 



EXHIBIT “A” 

LEGAL COSTS SUMMARY 

Re: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc.,
Urbancorp (Riverdale) Developments Inc. and Urbancorp (The Beach) Developments Inc.     

(collectively the “Urbancorp Entities”)

PROFESSIONAL 
YEAR OF 

CALL 
HOURLY RATE 

2017 
HOURLY 

RATE 2018 
HOURS 
BILLED 

Prophet, Cliff 1993 $855 $890 3.7 

Wong, Lilly  1990 $845 $860 85.5 

Betts, Ted 1997 $840 $860 30.9 

Rosen, Susan 1989 N/A $670 0.5 

Grover, Ajeet  2011 $560 N/A 16.2 

Carter, Kelby 2013 $460 N/A 1.0 

Parker, Brian T  Urban Planner $555 N/A 1.3 

Lifman, Olivia Student $250 N/A 1.6 

Mark G McAuley Student $250 N/A 3.8 

Santos, Lina Law Clerk N/A $325 0.6 

Emmanuel, Mark Corporate 
Searcher 

$125 N/A 1.0 

TOTAL HOURS BILLED 146.1 hours 
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SUMMARY OF ACCOUNTS 

No. Date of Account Fees Disbursements GST / HST Total

1. May 10, 2017
Invoice #18678818

$50,918.50 $754.05 $6,717.44 $58,389.99

2. July 5, 2017
Invoice #18713536

$6,336.50 $36.75 $827.49 $7,200.74

3. July 6, 2017
Invoice #18713547

$11,059.50 $291.01 $1,468.29 $12,818.80

4. August 17, 2017
Invoice #18737047

$11,766.00 $15.67 $1,531.62 $13,313.29

5. September 22, 2017
Invoice #18759707

$1,859.00 $0.00 $241.67 $2,100.67

6. December 6, 2017
Invoice # 18806672

$4,709.50 $38.10 $615.54 $5,363.14

7. December 31, 2017
Invoice # 18840187

$4,046.00 $0.00 $525.98 $4,571.98

8.  February 7, 2018
Invoice #18855002

$8,021.00 $0.00 $1,042.73 $9,063.73

9. April 25, 2018
Invoice #18899927

$3,536.00 $50.76 $464.71 $4,051.47

10. May 16, 2018
Invoice #18912543

$5,848.00 $4.76 $760.86 $6,613.62

TOTALS $108,100.00 $1,191.10 $14,196.33 $123,487.43

Total Fees before HST: $ 108,100.00 
÷ Total Hours Billed: 146.1

Average Hourly Rate
(before HST)

= $ 739.90

TOTAL AMOUNT $123,487.43



fnvoice 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J1 

Our Matter: T1008868 / 217991 

Q GOWLING WLG 

May 10, 2017 
INVOICE: 18678818 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(1 3.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $50,918.50 $6,619.41 

Disbursements (Taxable) 754.05 
Total Disbursements 754.05 98.03 

Total Fees and Disbursements 51,672.55 
Total Taxes 6,717.44 6,717.44 

Total Invoice 58,389.99 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $58,389.99 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Standard Terms of Business (www.qowlingwlq.comrrermsofBusiness), subject to any other 
written engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWUNG W LG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West. 
Suite 1600, Toronto. Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 11936 4511 RT 

T +1(416)862 7525 
gowlingwlg.com 

Gowling WlG (Canada) llP Is n member of Gowting WlG, an 
internallonnt law firm which consists of independent and autonomous 
cntitios providing services around tho wo~d. Our structuro Is oxplolncd ln 
moro detail at www.gowlingwlg corntlOa•I 
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Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 

0 GOWLING WLG 

May 10, 2017 
INVOICE: 18678818 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf including: 

Date Hours 

01/04/2017 2.60 

03/04/2017 1.30 

04/04/2017 1.60 

05/04/2017 6.20 

05/04/2017 4.60 

05/04/2017 2.60 

06/04/2017 1.30 

06/04/2017 1.60 

Timekeeper 

Ted Betts 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Ajeet Grover 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Description 

Revis in ; reviewing­
ardin remaining 

; reviewing 

Engaged regarding finalizing documents; communications 
regarding revisions; compiling schedules; telephone call with 
C. Doran regarding finalizing schedules; 

regarding same; finalizing 
discussion regarding and revising d 

sending out revised contract documents; 

Assist with various finalization matters in anticipation of final 
court approval of contracts and ancilla documentation; 
attend meetin with T. Betts to discuss 

re execution-ready versions of 
••land assemble same with all back-up 

documentation to prepare complete execution read 
versions; also re are same for the 

Engaged regarding finalizing documents; 

Numerous email correspondence and/or discussions with 
representatives of Blakes, Receiver, CIBC, GSNH, Gowlings 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 2 of 8 



Date Hours 

07/04/2017 1.30 

10/04/2017 2.10 

10/04/2017 0.50 

10/04/2017 2.70 

11/04/2017 

11/04/2017 

0.50 

2.30 

Timekeeper 

Ted Betts 

Ted Betts 

Ajeet Grover 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

0 GOWLING WLG 

May 10, 2017 
INVOICE: 18678818 

emails to and from T. Zaspalis 
; revising 

; isc ssion with L. Wong 
regarding finalizing 
sending and reading emails to and from B. Bissel regarding 
status of same; tele hone call with K. Peters regarding 

Email correspondence and/or discussions and/or conference 
calls with B. Bissell, representatives of Receiver, Blakes, 
Gowlin s, Altus and others with res ect to forms of 

to incorporate comments from 
Blakes and Receiver and other clean-up changes 

Engaged regarding finalizing documents; 

Email correspondence and/or discussions and/or conference 
calls with B. Bissell, representatives of Receiver, Blakes, 
Gowlin s, Altus and others with res ect to 

incorporate discussions 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 3 of 8 



Date Hours 

12/04/2017 1.40 

13/04/2017 1.20 

13/04/2017 1.20 

14/04/2017 1.00 

14/04/2017 2.30 

17/04/2017 0.90 

17/04/2017 7.80 

17/04/2017 2.80 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Ajeet Grover 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Ajeet Grover 

Lilly A Wong 

0 GOWLING WLG 

May 10, 2017 
INVOICE: 18678818 

Description 

Email correspondence and/or discussions and/or conference 
calls with B. Bissell, representatives of Receiver, Blakes, 
Gowlin s, Altus and others with res ect to 

Communications with workin 
documents; revising 
accordingly; 

Attend to telerone call discussion with T. Betts to dis?uss 
; review 

documentation posted to dropbox website for inclusion in 
final documentation; 

Engaged regarding finalizing documents; 

parties for review; email correspondence with 
representatives of Blakes, Receiver, Miller Thomson, 
Dickinson Wri ht and others with res ect to 

Engaged regarding finalizing documents 

Attending to various pre-closing matters including (1) various 

email correspondence with L. Wong a
1
ndlllTI. iBlielttls•2ll•I 

finalizin execution read versions of 
ting and 

finalizing ••land (4) 
coordinating review and finalization of various ancillary 
documentation including via dropbox website. 

Email correspondence and/or discussions and/or conference 
calls and/or consultations with representatives of Blakes, 
Gowlings, GSNH, Dickinson Wri ht, Receiver, Altus and/or 
CIBC with res ect to 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 4 of 8 



Date Hours Timekeeper 

18/04/2017 2.10 Ted Betts 

18/04/2017 1.80 Ajeet Grover 

18/04/2017 3.80 Lilly A Wong 

19/04/2017 0.80 Ted Betts 

19/04/2017 0.30 Ajeet Grover 

19/04/2017 1.30 Brian T Parker 

19/04/2017 1.90 Lilly A Wong 

0 GOWLING WLG 

Description 

May 10, 2017 
INVOICE: 18678818 

Reviewing finalizing ; email 
correspondence regarding inalizing and signing contract 
documents; preparing for and attending all parties 
conference call to finalizing open issues; 

Attending to pre-closing matters; attend all-party conference 
call 

Email correspondence and/or discussions and/or conference 
calls and/or consultations with representatives of Blakes, 
Gowlings, GSNH, Dickinson Wri ht, Receiver, Altus and/or 
CIBC with res ect to 

discussions with C. Doran and email 
response to B. Bissell; revised to 
incorporate discussions with"c. Doran and circulation of 
revised schedule to B. Bissell for review by Craft; 

~garding finalizing 
--communications regarding same; 

Consider email from 
ii to L. Wong and C. Doran 

with comments; 

Review conditional ermiV lannin materials received from 
L. Wong; review ; reporting 
memo to L. Wong; follow-up conference call with Lily 

Email correspondence and/or discussions and/or conference 
calls and/or consultations with representatives of Blakes, 
Gowlings, GSNH, Dickinson Wri ht, Receiver, Altus and/or 
ClijC with res ect to 

. 
compilation of executed definitive documents, and related 
matters; reviewed, revised and re-circulated -

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 5 of 8 



Date Hours Timekeeper 

20/04/2017 0.90 Ted Betts 

20/04/2017 2.70 Lilly A Wong 

21/04/2017 0.90 Lilly A Wong 

0 GOWLING WLG 

Description 

May 10, 2017 

INVOICE: 18678818 

••••••I; revised and re-circulated change orders 
to i~corporate clean-up chan51es; revised and circulated 
rev1sed············ 
review and discussion; 

~garding finalizing 
--; communications regarding same; 

Review of Craft proposed amendments to 
and discussions with C. Doran; revised 
••• o incorporate comments of C. Doran and 

circulation to B. Bissell for review; discussions with B. Bissell 
as to purpose o~revisions ; email 
correspondence and/or discussions with representatives of 
GSNH, Blakes, Gowlings. Receiver and/or CIBC with 
respect to I , completion of 
schedules to definitive agreements, confirmation of sign-off 
on definitive documentation, escrow conditions and release 
~es from escrow, re-execution of 
---and various matters relating to closing of 
execution of documents and release from escrow; 
discussions with C. Doran and review and revision of 

Preparation and circulation to Receiver, Blakes, GSNH, 
Dickinson Wright, Syndicate, Miller Thomson and Gowlings 
of fully executed versions of construction contract, 
development contract, TF cost overrun guarantee, Craft loan 
agreement and Syndicate loan agreement together with 
compiled schedules; email correspondence and/or 
discussions with representatives of Receiver, Blakes and 
Gowlings with respect to fee affidavits; 

Total Fees for Professional Services $50,918.50 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name Rate Hours 

Betts, Ted 840.00 22.20 

Grover, Ajeet 560.00 16.20 

Parker, Brian T. 555.00 1.30 

Wong, lilly A. 845.00 26.60 

Total 66.30 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 

Amount 

18,648.00 

9,072.00 

721.50 

22,477.00 

$50,918.50 

page 6 of 8 



0 GOWLING WLG 

Taxable Costs 

Copying 

Scanning Service 

Binding 

Conference Call Expenses 

Total Taxable Disbursements 

Terms: due upon receipt 

May 10, 2017 
INVOICE: 18678818 

$542.00 

$19.00 

$35.30 

$157.75 

$754.05 

Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 

page 1of8 



0 GOWLING WLG 

May 10, 2017 
INVOICE: 18678818 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$58,389.99 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street. Ottawa, ON K1 P 585 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CON Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 8 of 8 



. 
voice 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J1 

Our Matter: T1008868 / 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

July 5, 2017 
INVOICE: 18713536 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $6,336.50 $823.75 

Disbursements (Taxable) 28.75 
Disbursements (Non-Taxable) 8.00 
Total Disbursements 36.75 3.74 

Total Fees and Disbursements 6,373.25 
Total Taxes 827.49 827.49 
Total Invoice 7,200.74 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $7,200.74 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Terms of Business (www.gowlingwlg.com/TermsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 11936 451 1 RT 

T +1 (416) 862 7525 
gowlingwlg.com 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP is a member of Gowling WLG. an 
international law firm which consists of Independent and autonomous 
entities providing services around the world. Our structure is explained in 
moro detail at www gowlingWlg.comllegal 
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Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 

0 GOWLING WLG 

July 5, 2017 
INVOICE: 18713536 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Date 

02/06/2017 

02/06/2017 

05/06/2017 

08/06/2017 

20/06/2017 

21/06/2017 

30/06/2017 

Timekeeper 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Discussions and/or email correspondence and/or 
conference calls with representatives of Receiver, Altus, 
CIBC, Blakes, Craft and/or GSNH with respect tolexecution 
and delivery of final closing documents to satisfy conditions 
recedent to the material transaction documents, 

discussions and/or email corres 
B. Bissell with respect t~ 

Email correspondence and/or discussions with C. Doran, T. 
Zaspalis, B. Bissell, R. Sabato and others with re~pect to 

Discussions and/or email corres ondence with C. Doran and 
B. Bissell with res ect to 

Email correspondence with C. Doran and T. Zaspalis with 
respect to 1 ; 

Discussions and/or email c~ondence with C. Doran and 

~-~and further discussions with C. 
Prophet 

Review of Altus first Project Monitor's report and conference 
call with C. Doran and T. Zaspalis with respect thereto 

Total Fees for Professional Services $6,336.50 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name 

Betts, Ted 

Wong, Lilly A. 

Billed Rate 

840.00 

845.00 

Terms: due upon receipt 

Hours 

0.20 

7.30 

Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 

Amount 

168.00 

6,168.50 

page 2 of 4 



0 GOWLING WLG 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Taxable Costs 

Copying 

Scanning Service 

Corporate Searches - Taxable 

Total 

Total Taxable Disbursements 

Non-Taxable Costs 

Corporate Searches - Agency 

Total Non-Taxable Disbursements 

Tenns: due upon receipt 

July 5, 2017 

INVOICE: 18713536 

7.50 $6,336.50 

$1.00 

$4.75 

$23.00 

$28.75 

$8.00 

$8.00 

Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 
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0 GOWLING WLG 

July 5, 2017 

INVOICE: 18713536 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$7,200.74 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1 P 5B5 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CON Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
lntorost at the rate of 0.8% per annum will bo charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the dale of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page4 of 4 



Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON MSJ 2J 1 

Our Matter: T1008868 I 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

July 6, 2017 
INVOICE: 18713547 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $11,059.50 $1,437.74 

Disbursements (Taxable) 235.01 

Disbursements (Non-Taxable) 56.00 

Total Disbursements 291.01 30.55 

Total Fees and Disbursements 11,350.51 

Total Taxes 1,468.29 1,468.29 

Total Invoice 12,818.80 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $12,818.80 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Tenns of Business (www.gowlingwlg.comfTermsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 11936 4511 RT 

T +1 (416) 862 7525 
gowlingwlg.com 

Gowt;ng WLG (Canada) LLP ;s a member of Gowting WLG, an 
international lnw firm \\1hlch consists of independent and autonomous 
entiUes providing sorvlcos around tho world. Our sltucture is explained In 
more detail at www gow!loqwto co!l)lle99! 
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Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 

0 GOWLING WLG 

July 6, 2017 

INVOICE: 18713547 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Date 

07/04/2017 

11/05/2017 

15/05/2017 

15/05/2017 

16/05/2017 

18/05/2017 

18/05/2017 

18/05/2017 

18/05/2017 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Kelby A. Carter 

Mark Emmanuel 

Mark Emmanuel 

Lilly A Wong 

Description 

Discussions with B. Bissell with res 

consultations with T. Betts and C. Doran with respect to 
further revisions to nd revised and re-circulated 
further revised ; email correspondence with B. 
Bissell wfh further revised ~nd rationale for 

E-mail correspondence with C. Doran, ~lis 
and others with respect to execution of --­
-; e-mail correspondence with T. Betts and A. Grover 
with respect to ; 

; email correspondence with representatives 
of Receiver, Altus, Blakes, GSNH, Dickinson Wri ht and 
GWLG to confirm various items 

review of 
email correspondence from K. Peter with respe~t to I 

Email correspondence from 

Prepared PPSA draft for L. Wong; 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 2 of 5 



Date 

19/05/2017 

25/05/2017 

26/05/2017 

29/05/2017 

29/05/2017 

30/05/2017 

31/05/2017 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Kelby A. Carter 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

0 GOWLING WLG 

Description 

July 6, 2017 

INVOICE: 18713547 

PPSA financing statement for-; circulated draft 
documents to representatives of Receiver, Blakes, GSNH, 
CIBC and GWLG for review; email correspondence with K. 
Peters with respect to PPSA financing statement; email 
-ondence with T. Za~palis with respect to 

Discussions with B. Bissell with respect to -PPSA 
financing statement; 

Review of 
certificate; email correspondence 
, GSNH, Blakes and GWLG with 

Email c.6rrespondence and/or discussions with B. Bissell, T. 
Zas aliS. C. Doran, R. Fairbloom and others with res ect to 

conference call with B. Bissell, T. Zaspalis and K. Peters to 
review······ 
Revised PPSA financing statement and provided to client for 
sign off; 

Email correspondence with representatives of GSNH, 
Receiver, GWLG, Blakes and others with respect to 
outstanding closing conditions for proposed settlement 
transaction; 

Discussions and/or email correspondenlcle•wlitlhlC. Doran, T. 
Zas alis and B. Bissell with respect to 

; drafted and/o 

Email correspondence and/or discussions with 
representatives of GWLG, CIBC, Receivers, B. Bissell, R. 
Fairbloom and others with res ect to 

Total Fees for Professional Services $11.059.50 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 3 of 5 



0 GOWLING WLG 

TK Name 

Betts, Ted 

Carter, Kelby A. 

Emmanuel, Mark 

Wong, Lilly A. 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Taxable Costs 

Copying 

Scanning Service 

Binding 

Corporate Searches - Taxable 

Conference Call Expenses 

Total 

Total Taxable Disbursements 

Non-Taxable Costs 

Corporate Searches - Agency 

Total Non-Taxable Disbursements 

Billed Rate 

840.00 

460.00 

125.00 

845.00 

Terms: due upon receipt 

July 6, 2017 

INVOICE: 18713547 

Hours 

0.70 

1.00 

1.00 

11.70 

14.40 

Amount 

588.00 

460.00 

125.00 

9,886.50 

§11,059.50 

$23.00 

$5.25 

$44.05 

$68.25 

$94.46 

$235.01 

$56.00 

$56.00 

Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 

page4 of 5 



0 GOWLING WLG 

July 6, 2017 

INVOICE: 18713547 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$12,818.80 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1P 5B5 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CON Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 5 of 5 



VOi e 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J1 

Our Matter: T1008868 I 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

August17,2017 
INVOICE: 18737047 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $11,766.00 $1,529.58 

Disbursements (Taxable) 15.67 

Total Disbursements 15.67 2.04 

Total Fees and Disbursements 11,781.67 
Total Taxes 1,531.62 1,531.62 

Total Invoice 13,313.29 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $13,313.29 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Terms of Business (www.gowlingwlg.comfTermsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 11 936 4511 RT 

T +1 (416) 862 7525 
gowllngwlg.com 

Gowfing WLG (Conada) LLP is a mombor of Gowling WLG. on 
lntcrnotlonol low firm which consists of indopondont and autonomous 
onlitlos providing services around tho world. Our structuro is oxplainod In 
moro detail ot mm gowllngwtg convlogal 

page 1of4 



Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 

0 GOWLING WLG 

August 17, 2017 
INVOICE: 18737047 

Receivership of Urbancorp {Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Date Hours 

04/07/2017 0.60 

05/07/2017 0.90 

12/07/2017 4.20 

13/07/2017 3.30 

14/07/2017 1.20 

18/07/2017 0.40 

19/07/2017 0.80 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Description 

Review of revised •••••••• 

provided by T. Zaspalis; conference 
alis and C. Doran with respect to comments 

Email correspondence and/or discussions with T. Zas 
R. Gruneir and/or C. Doran with res ect to 

to request formal approval from Terra Firma; 

Review of email correspondence from P. Griffis provid ing 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 2 of 4 



Date Hours Timekeeper 

20/07/2017 3.80 Mark G McAuley 

20/07/2017 0.40 Lilly A Wong 

24/07/2017 0.40 Lilly A Wong 

26/07/2017 0.60 Lilly A Wong 

0 GOWLING WLG 

Description 

August 17, 2017 
INVOICE: 18737047 

Email correspondence and/or discussions with M. McAuley 
of GWLG, representatives of Receiver, P. Griffis and 

resentatives of RE/MAX with res ect to 

spect to 

Review of and 
distribution of fully executed copies to RE/MAX, Craft, 
Receiver and others; 

Discussions with T. Zaspalis and conference call with T. 
Zas alis and P. Griffis with res ect to 

Total Fees for Professional Services $11,766.00 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name 

McAuley, Mark G. 

Wong, Lilly A. 

Billed Rate 

250.00 

845.00 

Hours Amount 

3.80 950.00 

12.80 10,816.00 

Total 16.60 ~11,766.00 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Taxable Costs 

Conference Call Expenses 

Total Taxable Disbursements 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 

$15.67 

$15.67 

page 3 of 4 



0 GOWLING WLG 

August 17, 2017 

INVOICE: 18737047 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$13,313.29 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1 P 5B5 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CON Account: 41 -02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, NA BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 4 of 4 
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Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J1 

Our Matter: T1008868 I 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

September 22, 2017 
INVOICE: 18759707 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $1,859.00 $241.67 

Total Fees 1,859.00 

Total Taxes 241.67 241.67 

Total Invoice 2,100.67 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $2,100.67 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Terms of Business (www.gowlingwlg.com!TermsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West. 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 11936 4511 RT 

T +1(416)862 7525 
gowllngwlg.com 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP is a member of Go-Ming WLG. an 
internatiomil law firm which consists of independent and autonomous 
entities providing sorvicos around tho worSd. Our structure is explained in 
more detail al 1wov gow!lngwlg oorol!ogal 

page 1 of3 



Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 

0 GOWLING WLG 

September 22, 2017 

INVOICE: 18759707 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Date Hours 

16/08/2017 0.90 

17/08/2017 1.30 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

lilly A Wong 

Description 

Reviewed 
reviewed and revised email summarizing 
proposal and alternative options 

and 

Discussions with A. Kauffman and A. Slavens with respect 
to ; discussions with T. Zaspalis with 
res ect to discussions with A. Kauffman and A. Slavens, 

Total Fees for Professional Services $1 ,859.00 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name 

Wong, Lilly A. 

Total 

Billed Rate 

845.00 

Terms: due upon receipt 

Hours 

2.20 

2.20 

Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 

Amount 

1,859.00 

$1.859.00 

page 2 of 3 



0 GOWLING WLG 

September 22, 2017 

INVOICE: 18759707 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$2,100.67 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1 P 1 C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1 P 585 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CON Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIG: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to pavments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this Invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 3 of 3 



. 
nvo1ce 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON MSJ 2J1 

Our Matter: T1008868 / 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

December 6, 2017 
INVOICE: 18806672 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $4,709.50 $612.24 

Disbursements (Taxable) 25.40 
Disbursements (Non-Taxable) 12.70 

Total Disbursements 38.10 3.30 

Total Fees and Disbursements 4,747.60 
Total Taxes 615.54 615.54 

Total Invoice 5,363.14 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $5,363.14 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Terms of Business (www.gowlingwlg.comfTermsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place. 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GSTIHST: 11936 4511 RT 

T +1 (416) 862 7525 
gowlingwlg.com 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP is a member of Gowling WLG. an 
lnternaUonal law r.rm which consists of independent and autonomous 
ontitios providing sorvicos around tho woM. Our structure is explained in 
moro detail at V/WW gowJipgwlg com/legal 

page 1of4 



0 GOWLING WLG 

December 6, 2017 

INVOICE: 18806672 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 
Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf including: 

Date Hours 

13/10/2017 0.20 

17/10/2017 1.20 

18/10/2017 1.50 

25/10/2017 1.60 

25/10/2017 0.40 

26/10/2017 0 .80 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Olivia Lifman 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Description 

Preparation of draft fee affidavit 

Email correspondence with C. Mason, P. Griffis and T. 
Zas alis with respect to 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 2 of 4 



0 GOWLING WLG 

Total Fees for Professional Services 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name 

Lifman, Olivia 

Wong, Lilly A. 

Billed Rate 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Taxable Costs 

Total 

TeraView (Ontario) Online Searches & Registration - Taxable 

Total Taxable Disbursements 

Non-Taxable Costs 

TeraView (Ontario) Online Searches & Registration -Agency 

Total Non-Taxable Disbursements 

Terms: due upon receipt 

250.00 

845.00 

December 6, 2017 
INVOICE: 18806672 

Hours 

1.60 

5.10 

6.70 

$4.709.50 

Amount 

400.00 

4,309.50 

~4,709.50 

$25.40 

$25.40 

$12.70 

$12.70 

Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 

page 3 of 4 



0 GOWLING WLG 

December 6, 2017 
INVOICE: 18806672 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$5,363.14 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1 P 1 C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1P 585 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CON Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Tenns: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 4 of 4 



nvo1ce 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J1 

Our Matter: T1008868 I 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

December 31, 2017 
INVOICE: 18840187 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $4,046.00 $525.98 

Total Fees 4,046.00 
Total Taxes 525.98 525.98 
Total Invoice 4,571.98 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $4,571.98 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Terms of Business (www.gowlingwlg.comfTermsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600. Toronto, Ontario, MSX 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 119364511 RT 

T +1 (416) 862 7525 
gowlingwlg.com 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP is a member of Gowling WLG, an 
International law firm which consists of indopcndcnt and autonomous 
entities providing services around the world. Our structure is explained in 
more detail at www.gowlingwlg oomflegal 

page 1 of3 



0 GOWLING WLG 

December 31, 2017 

INVOICE: 18840187 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 
Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf including: 

Date Hours 

12/12/2017 1.10 

13/12/2017 2.00 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Description 

Discussions and/or email corres 
connection with 

Discussion with L. Won 
- reviewing cl•••••• regarding same; 
preparing for and attending conference call with T. Zaspalis, 
C. Doran and L. Wong regarding same; 

13/12/2017 1.20 Lilly A Wong 

15/12/2017 0.50 Lilly A Wong 

Total Fees for Professional Services 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name Billed Rate Hours 

Betts, Ted 840.00 2.00 

Wong, Lilly A. 845.00 2.80 

Total 4.80 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 

$4.046.00 

Amount 

1,680.00 

2,366.00 

~4,046.00 

page 2 of 3 



0 GOWLING WLG 

December 31, 2017 

INVOICE: 18840187 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$4,571.98 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG {Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1 P 1 C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1P 5B5 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CDN Account: 41 -02916 
USD Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlinqwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 0.8% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 3 of3 



\! 01ce 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J 1 

Our Matter: T1008868 I 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

February7, 2018 
INVOICE: 18855002 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $8,021.00 $1,042.73 

Total Fees 8,021.00 
Total Taxes 1,042.73 1,042.73 

Total Invoice 9,063.73 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $9,063.73 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Terms of Business (www.gowlingwlg.com/TermsofBusiness). subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 119364511 RT 

T +1(416)862 7525 
gowlingwlg.com 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP is a membor of Gowling WLG, an 
international law firm which consists of indopendont and autonomous 
entities providing services around tho wo~d. Our structure is explained in 
more detail at \WNf gowtingwlg com/legal 

page 1of4 



Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 

0 GOWLING WLG 

February 7, 2018 

INVOICE: 18855002 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf including: 

Date Hours 

11/01/2018 0.90 

12/01/2018 0.60 

16/01/2018 2.20 

17/01/2018 

17/01/2018 

18/01/2018 

19/01/2018 

19/01/2018 

22/01/2018 

22/01/2018 

24/01/2018 

0.30 

0.40 

0.20 

0.80 

0.60 

0.80 

0.90 

0.40 

Timekeeper 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Ted Betts 

Lilly A Wong 

Lilly A Wong 

Description 

Discussions with T. Zas 

Savoie; 

Reviewed and revised draft email to L. Savoie -
; email corres ondence with 

T. Zaspalis with respect to ; further 
revision of draft email to L. Savoie 

Reviewing and revising draft email regarding changes; 

Review of email corres ondence from 

: revising draft email regarding changes; 

Review of suggested revisions from T. Betts for the draft 
email from C. Doran to Craft; incorporated revisions and 
circulated draft email to T. Zaspalis and C. Doran for review; 
email correspondence with T. Zaspalis and incorporation of 
further revisions to draft email 

Preparing for and attending conference call with L. Wong, C. 
Doran and T. Zaspalis regarding 

Conference call with T. Zaspalis, C. Doran and T. Betts to 
review draft email to Craft with res ect to 

revised and re-circulated draft email to Craft 
incorporating changes discussed 

Review of email correspondence from C. Doran setting out 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 1.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 2 of 4 



Date Hours Timekeeper 

29/01/2018 0.60 Lina Santos 

29/01/2018 0.40 Lilly A Wong 

30/01/2018 0.60 Lilly A Wong 

0 GOWLING WLG 

Description 

February 7, 2018 

INVOICE: 18855002 

review of draft email 
correspondence to Craft from and/or discussions with T. 
Zas alis with res ect to draft email to Craft 

Engaged in reviewing email and attachments from L. Wong; 
access Tera view to conduct subsearch of title to locate 
lands; email search results to L. Wong; 

email correspondence with T. Zaspalis 

Review of draft email relating to ••••••• and 
discussions with T. Zas alis; revised and circulated revised 
draft email to T. Zaspalis 

Total Fees for Professional Services $8,021.00 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name Billed Rate Hours 

Betts, Ted 860.00 1.90 

Santos. Lina 325.00 0.60 

Wong, Lilly A. 860.00 7.20 

Total 9.70 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 1.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 

Amount 

1,634.00 

195.00 

6,192.00 

~8,021.00 
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0 GOWLING WLG 

February 7, 2018 

INVOICE: 18855002 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$9,063.73 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATI 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1 P 5B5 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CDN Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 1.3% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
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e 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J 1 

Our Matter: T1008868 / 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

April 25, 2018 
INVOICE: 18899927 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville} Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $3,536.00 $459.68 

Disbursements (Taxable} 38.71 
Disbursements (Non-Taxable) 12.05 

Total Disbursements 50.76 5.03 

Total Fees and Disbursements 3,586.76 

Total Taxes 464.71 464.71 

Total Invoice 4,051.47 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $4,051.47 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Terms of Business (www.gowtingwlg.comfTermsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GSTIHST: 11936 4511 RT 

T +1 (416) 862 7525 
gowlingwlg.com 

Gowling WLG (Cnnodo) LLP Is a member of Gowling WLG. on 
international law firm wh1th consists of independent and autonomous 
entities providing servicos around tho world. Our slrucluro is oxplaincd In 
more detail al www gowlingwtg co!!\llogol 
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Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 

. 
0 GOWLING WLG 

April 25, 2018 
INVOICE: 18899927 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf including: 

Date 

2018-03-16 

2018-03-19 

2018-03-21 

2018-03-21 

Hours Timekeeper 

0.30 Lilly A Wong 

2.60 Lilly A Wong 

0.40 Susan D. Rosen 

0.90 Lilly A Wong 

Description 

ontgomery with 

Review of T. Zas alis comments on-­
reviewed a~ 
email correspondence with T. 

~withrespectto­
~review of comments from R. 
Fairbloom 

Email correspondence and/or discussions with T. Zaspalis, 
S. Rosen C. Doran and others with res ect to 

Total Fees for Professional Services $3.536.00 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name 

Rosen, Susan D. 

Wong, Lilly A. 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Taxable Costs 

Copying 

Scanning Service 

Total 

Billed Rate 

670.00 

860.00 

TeraView (Ontario) Online Searches & Registration - Taxable 

Terms: due upon receipt 

Hours 

0.40 

3.80 

4.20 

Interest at the rate of 1.5% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 

Amount 

268.00 

3,268.00 

$3.536.00 

$1.50 

$2.00 

$29.75 
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0 GOWLING WLG 

Conference Call Expenses 

Total Taxable Disbursements 

Non-Taxable Costs 

TeraView (Ontario) Online Searches & Registration -Agency 

Total Non-Taxable Disbursements 

Tenns: due upon receipt 

April 25, 2018 
INVOICE: 18899927 

$5.46 

$38.71 

$12.05 

$12.05 

Interest at the rate of 1.5% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 
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0 GOWLING WLG 

April 25, 2018 

INVOICE: 18899927 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$4,051.47 CAD 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1 P 5B5 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CON Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. BIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

" if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 1.5% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the dale of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
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Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
ATTN: Doug Mcintosh 
Managing Director 
Royal Bank Plaza 
South Tower 
200 Bay Street 
Suite 2900 
Toronto ON M5J 2J1 

Our Matter: T1008868 I 217991 

0 GOWLING WLG 

May 16, 2018 
INVOICE: 18912543 

RE: Receivership of Urbancorp (leslieville) Developments Inc. 

HST 
(13.0%) 

Fees for Professional Services $5,848.00 $760.24 

Disbursements (Taxable) 4.76 

Total Disbursements 4.76 0.62 

Total Fees and Disbursements 5,852.76 

Total Taxes 760.86 760.86 

Total Invoice 6,613.62 

Please remit balance due: In Canadian Dollars $6,613.62 

Lilly A. Wong Signed for & on behalf of Gow1ing WLG (Canada) LLP 

Our services are provided in accordance with our Tenns of Business (www.qowlinqw!g.comrrennsofBusiness), subject to any other written 
engagement agreement entered into between the parties. 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
1 First Canadian Place, 100 King Street West, 
Suite 1600, Toronto, Ontario, M5X 1G5, Canada 

GST/HST: 11936 4511 RT 

T +1(416)862 7525 
gowllngwlg.com 

Gowting WLG (Canoda) LLP Is a member of Gowling WLG. on 
international law firm which consists of indopcndcnl and autonomous 
entities providing sorvlcos around the wMd. Our svucturo is explained In 
more delail at www.gowllnqwlg comlloqal 
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0 GOWLING WLG 

May 16, 2018 
INVOICE: 18912543 

Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
Our Matter: T1008868 
Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments 
Inc. 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED on your behalf including: 

Date 

2018-04-04 

2018-04-09 

2018-04-10 

2018-04-12 

2018-04-12 

2018-04-13 

2018-04-19 

2018-04-20 

Hours Timekeeper 

1.10 Lilly A Wong 

0.60 Lilly A Wong 

0.60 Lilly A Wong 

0.10 Susan D. Rosen 

0.20 Lilly A Wong 

0.60 Lilly A Wong 

1.20 Cliff Prophet 

2.30 Cliff Prophet 

Description 

Conference call with re 
respect to 

and discussions with 

Email correspondence and/or discussions with T. Zas 
C. Doran and others with res ect 

Review of construction lien matters and instructions to D. 
Contractor; 

Review of motion record re HST priority and e-mails to B. 
Bissell re same; 

Total Fees for Professional Services $5.848.00 

Terms: due upon ~ipt 
Interest at the rate of 1.5% per annum wm be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
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0 GOWLING WLG 

SUMMARY OF FEES 

TK Name 

Prophet, Cliff 

Rosen, Susan D. 

Wong, Lilly A. 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Taxable Costs 

Conference Call Expenses 

Total 

Billed Rate 

890.00 

670.00 

860.00 

Total Taxable Disbursements 

Terms: due upon receipt 

May 16, 2018 

INVOICE: 18912543 

Hours 

3.50 

0.10 

3.10 

6.70 

Amount 

3, 115.00 

67.00 

2,666.00 

~5,848.00 

$4.76 

KI§ 

Interest at the rate of 1.5% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 
Errors and omissions excluded 
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0 GOWLING WLG 

May 16, 2018 

INVOICE: 18912543 

Remittance Copy 

Client: 
Matter: 

217991 Alvarez & Marsal Canada Inc. 
T1008868 

RE: 
Amount Due: 

Receivership of Urbancorp (Leslieville) Developments Inc. 
$6,613.62 CAD 

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE: 

Please return this page with your payment payable to Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 

Remit to: Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
PO Box 466, STN D 

PAYMENT BY WIRE TRANSFER: 

Pay by Swift MT 103 Direct to: 
SWIFTCODE: 

BENEFICIARY BANK: 

TRANSIT NUMBER: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: 

BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NUMBER(S): 

Ottawa, ON K1P 1C3 
Canada 

CIBCCATT 

Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 
119 Sparks Street, Ottawa, ON K1 P 5B5 

0010-00006 

Gowling WLG (Canada) LLP 
160 Elgin Street, Suite 2600, Ottawa ,ON K1P 1C3 

CDN Account: 41-02916 
USO Account: 02-21015 

US Corresponding Bank for US Dollar wires: 
Wells Fargo Bank, N.A. SIC: PNBPUS3NNYC - ABA:026005092 

* if paying by wire or EFT please e-mail the remittance details to payments.ca@gowlingwlg.com 

Terms: due upon receipt 
Interest at the rate of 1.5% per annum will be charged on all amounts not paid within one month from the date of this invoice 

Errors and omissions excluded 
page 4 of 4 



Court File No.: CV-16-1 1409-00CL 

BETWEEN: 

CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE - and - URBANCORP (LESLIEVILLE DEVELOPMENTS) INC. et al. 

- Applicant - - Respondents -

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(Commercial List) 

(PROCEEDING COMMENCED AT TORONTO) 

AFFIDAVIT OF LILLY A. WONG 
(Sworn JUNE 12, 2018) 

GOWLING WLG (CANADA) LLP 
Barristers and Solicitors 
Suite 1600, 1 First Canadian Place 
Toronto, Ontario 
MSX 1G5 

Clifton P. Prophet, LSUC #34845K 

Telephone: (416) 862-3509 
Facsimile: ( 416) 863-3509 

Solicitors for the Applicant, 
Canadian Imperial Bank of Commerce 

TOR_LAW\ 9540065\1 
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CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE V. URBANCORP (LESLIEVILLE) 
DEVELOPMENTS INC. et. al. 

 Court File No. CV-16-11409-00CL

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 
Proceeding commenced at Toronto 

COMPENDIUM OF FEE AFFIDAVITS 
(Returnable June 26, 2018) 

BLAKE, CASSELS & GRAYDON LLP
Suite 4000, Commerce Court West 
199 Bay Street 
Toronto Ontario M5L 1A9 

Pamela L.J. Huff - LSO#: 27344V 
Tel: 416-863-2958 
Fax: 416-863-2653 
Email: pamela.huff@blakes.com

Chris Burr – LSO#: 55172H  
Tel: 416-863-3361 
Fax: 416-863-2653 
Email: chris.burr@blakes.com

Independent Counsel for Alvarez & Marsal 
Canada Inc., in its capacity as both Receiver and 
Manager, and Construction Lien Trustee of the 
assets, undertakings and property of Urbancorp 
(Leslieville) Developments Inc., Urbancorp 
(Riverdale) Developments Inc., and Urbancorp 
(The Beach) Developments Inc.


